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specialists in any aspect of humanity in the Arctic. (Piers
Vitebsky, Scott Polar Research Institute, University of
Cambridge, Lensfield Road, Cambridge CB2 1ER)

HERDING IN PERSPECTIVE
THE WORLD OF PASTORALISM: HERDING SYS-
TEMS IN COMPARATIVE PERSPECTIVE. Galaty.J.
and Johnson, D. L. (editors). 1990. London, Guilford
Press and Belhaven Press. 436 p, illustrated, hard cover.
ISBN 1-85293-176-0.
This is a useful compendium of information on pastoral
systems in all ecological zones, from African cattle to
Andean camelids. It is a good textbook for anthropologists
and geographers and the authors pay particular attention to
the development dimension.

The article likely to be of main interest to polar readers
is Hugh Beach's on 'Comparative systems of reindeer
herding', covering Fennoscandia, Alaska, the USSR,
Greenland and Canada. Beach discusses common de-
nominators and local variations, covering both the envi-
ronment and the ethnic and political struggles which have
arisen at the margins of powerful industrial states, as well
as conflicts with industrialisation arid the decline of re-
cruitment and the trend towards the cash economy. Much
of the general discussion applies only to Fennoscandia,
though this is not always made clear, and the author's
experience and sources come largely from this region.

The article's weakness as a comparative survey lies in
its coverage of the Soviet Union, which contains nearly
80% of the world's domesticated reindeer and where
reindeer form the foundation of vast regional economies.
Without Russian, Beach has relied on a very limited range
of sources, as well as on a visit to a state farm in Yakutia.
But the debates and policy dilemmas which he understands
well in Fennoscandia are inaccessible without extensive
reading in the large and controversial Russian literature;
while it would help the reader to be told that the farm he
visited is a showpiece to which foreigners are often es-
corted and is far from typical. On the basis of longer
fieldwork in the region, it is hard to agree unequivocally
that 'reindeer herding faces its brightest future in the
Soviet Union', that extractive industries there have not
pressed herding to the wall, or that the state is working to
remedy the drop in recruitment.
However, the general discussion and the picture of rein-
deer herding given for the other countries are very helpful
and there is an excellent classified entry in the index under
'reindeer' which occupies almost three columns. (Piers
Vitebsky, Scott Polar Research Institute, University of
Cambridge, Lensfield Road, Cambridge CB2 1ER.)

BRIEF REVIEWS
NORTHWESTPASS AGE: THE QUEST FOR AN ARC-
TIC ROUTE TO THE EAST. Struzik, E. and Beedell, M.
1991. London, Blandford Press. 152 p, illustrated, hard
cover. ISBN 0-7137-2246-0. £16.95.

Struzik is a journalist, Beedell a photographer: both have
ample first-hand experience of the Passage, and their joint
account of it is a delight. The text is a blend of history,

natural history, anthropology, geography, personal stories
and good yams from the past. The photographs — 60 in
colour and almost as many in black and white—are quite
superb. A marvellous book to give anyone as an after-
Christmas present.

SAAMI CULTURAL RESEARCH IN SWEDEN 1990.
Kvist, R. 1991. Centre for Arctic Cultural Research,
Umea University (Miscellaneous Publications 11). 57 p,
soft cover. ISSN 0283-9687.
READINGS IN SAAMI HISTORY, CULTURE AND
LANGUAGE II. Kvist, R. 1991. Centre for Arctic
Cultural Research, Umea University (Miscellaneous Pub-
lications 12). 158 p, illustrated, soft cover. ISSN 0283-
9687.

Two publications from a lively Swedish source. The first,
a catalogue of one-page summaries of current or recently-
completed Swedish Saami cultural studies, will be of
interest to anyone involved in similar studies in the hu-
manities, social sciences, physical anthropology and the-
ology. The second is a collection of articles in English on
Saami culture, history and language, with perspectives on
culture and research: four of the articles are on archaeology
and the remaining six from ethnology, history, anthropol-
ogy and linguistics: subjects range from the prehistoric use
of pitfalls in Asele Lappmark to a Saami strategy for
language preservation. Obtainable from the Centre, Uni-
versity of Umea, S-901 87, Umea, Sweden.

THE STATE OF THE ARCTIC ENVIRONMENT. Pre-
pared by Nenonen, M. 1991. Rovaniemi, University of
Lapland. 405 p, illustrated, soft cover. ISBN 951-634-
231-0.

Arising from a series of meetings between scientists from
the Arctic countries, this volume presents six state-of-the-
environment reports on aspects of international coopera-
tion in environmental protection. Articles cover man-
made acidification (Nenonen), heavy metals (Melnikov),
underwater noise (Davis and others), oil pollution (Futsaeter
and others), organochlorines (Jensen) and radioactivity
(Paakkola). Obtainable from the Arctic Centre, University
of Lapland, PO Box 122,96101 Rovaniemi, Finland.

BACK FROM THE BRINK: THE ROAD TO MUSKOX
CONSERVATION IN THE NORTHWEST TERRITO-
RIES. Barr, W. 1991. Calgary, University of Calgary
(Komatik Series 3). 127 p, illustrated, soft cover. ISBN0-
919034-67-5. Can$23.00 including postage.

A detailed account of the decline of muskoxen under
hunting pressures during the 19th century, and their subse-
quentrecovery under protection. Formerly widespread on
most of the Canadian Arctic islands and across the main-
land between Anderson River in the northwest and Rae
Isthmus and Churchill in the east, they were hunted commer-
cially for meat, hides and furs. Mainland populations,
reduced to a few hundred by 1917, have now recovered to
over 13,000. The author tells their story within the context
of Canadian history, relating — among other curious
events — how threats to the species led to the establish-
ment of a Canadian presence in the high Arctic, and
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