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Editorial

Alzheimer’s disease (AD) is a treatable disorder.
Two classes of anti-dementia agents have emerged
in the recent past: anti-oxidants and cholinesterase
inhibitors. A recent study1 showed that the
anti-oxidants alpha tocopherol (vitamin E) and
selegiline slowed the progress of AD. Patients
treated with either agent alone or with both
agents in combination progressed to end-point
more slowly than patients on placebo. Patients on
placebo reached one of the end-points – death,
nursing home placement, progression to severe
AD, or significant loss of activities of daily living
– in approximately 400 days, whereas patients on
active agent required approximately 600 days to
reach the same end-points. Both these agents have
anti-oxidant properties; selegiline is a monoamine
oxidase-B inhibitor that reduces free radical
generation and alpha tocopherol has free radical
capture capabilities. These agents are applied to
patients in mild or moderate phases of AD, where
slowing the progression of the illness and main-
tenance of patients at higher levels of function are
the principal goals. Slowing the progression of the
disease in more advanced phases of the illness may
be less desirable.

Cholinesterase inhibitors address the choliner-
gic deficiency in AD and have been developed for
patients with mild to moderate severity of demen-
tia. The average response is a four-point improve-
ment on a cognitive scale equivalent to reversal of
approximately seven months of decline.2–4 Patients
usually present for treatment several years after
the onset of symptoms and most patients will not
be treated with these agents in the later phases of
the disease when cognitive impairment is severe.
Thus, the treatment opportunity window is lim-
ited to approximately five years, and a seven- to
12-month reversal of symptoms represents a sub-
stantial and clinically compelling response. In
addition to changes in cognition, cholinesterase

inhibitors also have a beneficial effect on behav-
iour, reducing apathy, visual hallucinations and
purposeless activity such as pacing.5,6 Cognitive
and behavioural abnormalities in AD produce dis-
tress in caregivers, and improvement in either of
these domains ameliorates caregiver burden.5

Cholinesterase inhibitors exert less potent
effects than required of an ideal anti-dementia
agent. Although their beneficial effects are sus-
tained relative to placebo, there is continuing
decline in patients receiving anti-dementia ther-
apy. Anti-amyloid agents, anti-inflammatory
drugs, and agents affecting apoptosis or excitatory
amino acid toxicity have promise as drugs that
will defer the onset or slow the progression of AD.
These agents, however, do not improve existing
symptoms. Cholinesterase inhibitors7 improve
symptoms but appear to exert little influence on
disease course. Thus, a combination of anti-
dementia drugs, including compounds that will
interfere in the basic disease process and agents
that improve symptoms will comprise an optimal
anti-dementia regimen. Cholinergic drugs are
likely to continue to play an important role in
anti-dementia therapy despite the emergence of
newer, more powerful agents.

Acknowledgements

This project was supported by a National Institute
on Aging Alzheimer’s Disease Center grant (AG
10123), an Alzheimer’s Disease Research Center
of California grant, and the Sidell-Kagan
Foundation.

References

1 Sano M, Ernesto C, Thomas RG et al. A
controlled trial of selegiline, alpha-tocopherol, or
both as treatment for Alzheimer’s disease. N Engl
J Med 1997; 336: 1216–42.

2 Cummings JL, Cyrus PA, Bieber F, Mas J, Orazem

Anti-dementia drugs: what difference do they
make?
Jeffrey L Cummings
Departments of Neurology, Psychiatry and Biobehavioral Sciences, UCLA School of Medicine, Los Angeles,
CA, USA

https://doi.org/10.1017/S0959259898008417 Published online by Cambridge University Press

https://doi.org/10.1017/S0959259898008417


J, Gulanski B, the Metrifonate Study Group.
Metrifonate treatment of the cognitive deficits of
Alzheimer’s disease. Neurology 1998; 50: 1214–21.

3 Knapp MJ, Knopman DS, Solomon PR, Pendlebury
WW, Davis CS, Gracon SI for the Tacrine Study
Group. A 30-week randomized controlled trial of
high-dose tacrine in patients with Alzheimer’s
disease. JAMA 1994; 271: 985–91.

4 Rogers SL, Farlow MR, Doody RS, Mohs R,
Friedhoff LT, the Donepezil Study Group. A
24-week, double-blind, placebo-controlled trial of
donepezil in patients with Alzheimer’s disease.
Neurology 1998; 50:136–45.

5 Kaufer D, Cummings JL, Christine D. Effect of
tacrine on behavioral symptoms in Alzheimer’s
disease: an open label. J Neuropsychiatry Clin
Neurosci 1998; 10: 55–63.

6 Morris JC, Cyrus PA, Orazem J et al . Metrifonate
benefits cognitive, behavioral, and global function
in patients with Alzheimer’s disease. Neurology
1998; 50: 1222–30.

7 Cummings JL, Vinters HV, Cole GM,
Khachaturian ZS. Alzheimer’s disease: Etiologies,
pathophysiology, cognitive reserve, and treatment
opportunities. Neurology 1998; 51 (suppl 1):
S2–S17.

280 Editorial

https://doi.org/10.1017/S0959259898008417 Published online by Cambridge University Press

https://doi.org/10.1017/S0959259898008417

