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I find reading Cajal as rewarding as reading Darwin. One finds 
the same eager search for discovery, as these true pioneers navigate 
a new world using their tremendous skill for observing nature and 
interpreting what they see. If in Darwin we find the first, labored but 
clear, glimpses of evolution as the fundamental principle of biology, 
in Cajal we watch the emergence of the neuronal doctrine as the 
basis of modern neuroscience. The idea against which Cajal fought, 
one in which all neurons were interconnected through cytoplasmic 
bridges and thus constituted a single cell miasma, is as incompatible 
with the development of basic and clinical neuroscience as 
creationism is inconsistent with genomic data, and astronomy with 
the similarly intuitive belief that the sun revolves around the earth. 
However, for the busy professional reader, there were three obstacles 
to enjoying Cajal's work: the first is that one would like to be certain 
that the information acquired has not been corrected along the 
development of neuroscience during the 20th century. The second is 
that the quality of the illustrations in most currently available 
editions is, to put it kindly, abysmal. The third is that Cajal's work 
was originally published in Spanish and French, and many current 
workers in basic and clinical neuroscience are not familiar with these 
languages. The edition of Pasik and Pasik addresses all three 
problems. It is much more than a modern translation. It provides 
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comments to view Cajal writings in the light of current knowledge. 
This implies often supplying the contemporary nomenclature of the 
structures described by Cajal, sometimes adding information 
obtained through electron microscopic and labeling techniques to 
which Cajal had no access, and occasionally correcting errors. The 
illustrations, obtained by digging out the original drawings, are 
superb, and replace the need for the leaps of faith one had to have 
with the previous editions. Finally, the translation renders in good 
English the original Spanish and French texts that are combined as 
the source. The book will make for an enjoyable and profitable quiet 
reading, and is a wonderful gift to any neuroscientist. 

David G. Munoz 
Madrid, Spain 

CORTEX AND MIND. 2003. By J.M. Fuster. Published by Oxford 
University Press. 294 pages. C$87.50 approx. 

What I liked about this book is that it made me look at the brain 
and its functions in a light that we don't often direct toward 
neuroscientific issues. In particular, Dr. Fuster presents new insights 
into how the brain is organized functionally. 

At first glance, the focus of the book appeared to be on the brain-
mind dichotomy, the age-old dilemma with which most 
neuroscientists grapple, particularly as the neuroscientist moves 
along in his/her academic life. In fact, the preface of the book at first 
strongly intimated that this was the focus. Fuster states, "My 
ultimate objective is to substantiate the correlations between a neural 
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