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York: Norton, 2003), Janáček and His World (Princeton:
Princeton University Press, 2003) and Martinů’s Mysteri-
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training of composers in the conservatories of Naples
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Ende der Geschichte bei Theodor W. Adorno und Wolfgang
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monograph, on ‘Music and Moral-Ethical Change around
1700 – Paris, London, Hamburg’.
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Adeline Mueller is a doctoral candidate in musicology at
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studied music at the University of Edinburgh, from where
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August 2005 took over as Curator of the Museum at the
Royal College of Music. Jenny’s research interests include
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the context, design and construction of historical musical
instruments, and she is working towards a PhD in the
Sociology Department of Goldsmiths College, University
of London, studying the lives and businesses of instrument
makers in London, c1750–1810. She continues to sing when-
ever possible, including recent performances of Handel’s
Saul with The Wensleydale Chorus, Mozart’s Exsultate
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Sydney and his PhD from the University of Queensland.
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da Gamba Music of the Berlin School was published by
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sity Press, 2002), has written many articles on nineteenth-
century music and music in cultural context, and is at work
on a textbook on opera.
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range of music (from medieval polyphony to contempo-
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He served as an elected member of the executive com-
mittee of the British Society of Aesthetics from 2001 to
2007, and was appointed a trustee of the Accademia
Monteverdiana in 2005. He has recently published on
Monteverdi, Mozart and Vivaldi, and on the aesthetics of
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ductions, California. He is Chair of RISM Ireland and a
Council Member and Honorary Treasurer of the Society
for Musicology in Ireland.
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eighteenth-century music. His most recent book, Mozart
on the Stage, was published in 2009 by Cambridge Univer-
sity Press.

For twelve years Head of Postgraduate Programmes and
Research at the Royal Welsh College of Music and Drama,
Lucy Robinson now divides her time between research,
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and French baroque music, and she plays regularly with the
Welsh Baroque Orchestra. She has recently administered
and taught on an international course on baroque string
playing, Marnaves Summer Baroque, in France.

Stephen Rose is Lecturer in Music at Royal Holloway,
University of London. His research focuses on German
music of the seventeenth and eighteenth centuries in its
social, material and performing contexts; he has recently
completed a book on the musician-novels of the German
Baroque. He is currently Reviews Editor of Early Music.

Matthias Schmidt is Professor of Musicology at the Uni-
versität Basel. His research focuses on the music history
and aesthetics of the classical and romantic periods, and on
the Second Viennese School. His recent books include
Johannes Brahms: Ein Versuch über die musikalische Selb-
streflexion (Wilhelshaven: Noetzel, 2000) and Schönberg
und Mozart: Aspekte einer Rezeptionsgeschichte (Vienna:
Lafite, 2004); he has also edited Kunst lernen: Zur Vermit-
tlung musikpädagogischer Meisterkompositionen des 20.
Jahrhunderts (Regensburg: ConBrio, 2008).

Thomas Schmidt-Beste has been Professor and Head of
Music at Bangor University since 2005, having held pre-
vious positions in Heidelberg, Urbana and Frankfurt. In
2008 he was a Visiting Fellow at All Souls College, Oxford.
His main areas of research are music of the fifteenth and
sixteenth centuries and German music of the late eight-
eenth and nineteenth centuries, Mendelssohn and Mozart
in particular. Major recent publications are Textdeklama-
tion in der Motette des 15. Jahrhunderts (Turnhout: Brepols,
2003), Die Sonate: Geschichte – Formen – Ästhetik (Kassel:
Bärenreiter, 2006; English translation as Cambridge Intro-
duction to the Sonata to appear in 2010) and critical editions
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of Mendelssohn’s ‘Scottish’ and ‘Italian’ Symphonies in
the Leipziger Mendelssohn Ausgabe (Wiesbaden: Breitkopf
& Härtel, 2005 and 2009). Current projects include an
edition of Mendelssohn’s incidental music Antigone for
the Mendelssohn Ausgabe and the Digital Image Archive
of Medieval Music (DIAMM), which he co-directs with
Margaret Bent and Julia Craig-McFeely.

Ayana Smith is Assistant Professor of Musicology at the
Jacobs School of Music of Indiana University. Her research
interests focus on literary criticism, aesthetics and dra-
matic vocal music in Italy during the late seventeenth and
early eighteenth centuries. She received her doctorate in
music history from Yale University and was awarded a
Woodrow Wilson Junior Faculty Career Enhancement
Grant in 2008–2009. Her research on iconography, gender
and Neoplatonism in Arcadian aesthetics is forthcoming
in Music and Art, and she is preparing a book manuscript
that explores music, imagery and perception within the
Arcadian Academy. She has also published on the topic of
the signifying trickster figure in African-American blues
narratives and compositional practice in Popular Music.

Janice B. Stockigt is a Principal Fellow at the School of
Music at The University of Melbourne whose research is
centred on the music of the Dresden court during the first
half of the eighteenth century. Her monograph Jan Dismas
Zelenka (1679–1745): A Bohemian Musician at the Court of
Dresden (New York: Oxford University Press, 2000) was
awarded the Derek Allen Prize of the British Academy and
the Woodward Medal of The University of Melbourne in
2001. In 2005 she discovered a lost work of Vivaldi (Dixit
Dominus, RV807), kept under Baldassarre Galuppi’s name
in the Sächsische Landesbibliothek – Staats- und Univer-
sitätsbibliothek Dresden.

Thomas Strange has an extensive background in materials
science and is the author of thirty-nine patents and numer-
ous papers over the last two decades covering all aspects of
capacitor development, with an emphasis on foil develop-
ment for aluminum electrolytics. Following studies in
physics at the University of South Carolina, he joined
Philips Components as a member of the research staff.
He was a member of a small team of entrepreneurs who
developed and produced the pioneering flat medical-grade

electrolytic capacitor that made thoracic implantable car-
dioverter defibrillators possible. For the last thirty years
Strange has built and restored numerous antique keyboard
instruments, including the tangent piano after Spath,
Viennese fortepianos and harpsichords. He is a regular
contributor to the Friends of Square Pianos website
<http://www.friendsofsquarepianos.co.uk> and Yahoo
fortepiano forum.

Jeanne Swack is Professor of Musicology and Jewish
Studies at the University of Wisconsin-Madison. Her work
centres on Bach, Telemann and performance practice, and
on the portrayal of Jews in early eighteenth-century music.
She is a recipient of the William Scheide Award from the
American Bach Society and also performs on the Baroque
traverso.

Michael Talbot is Emeritus Professor of Music at the Uni-
versity of Liverpool and a Fellow of the British Academy.
He has published extensively on Vivaldi and his Italian
contemporaries, co-editing the yearbook Studi vivaldiani
and contributing numerous volumes to the New Critical
Edition of Vivaldi’s works. His book The Chamber Canta-
tas of Antonio Vivaldi was published in 2006 (Woodbridge:
Boydell), and a new book, Vivaldi and Fugue, appeared in
2009 (Florence: Olschki).

Ian Woodfield is Professor of Historical Musicology at
Queen’s University Belfast. His PhD (King’s College
London, 1977), on the origins of the viola da gamba, was
published as The Early History of the Viol (Cambridge:
Cambridge University Press, 1984). A second monograph,
English Musicians in the Age of Exploration (Stuyvesant:
Pendragon, 1995), represented an early foray into the field
of musical interculturalism. More recently, the focus of his
research has changed to the eighteenth century, with
studies on social and institutional history: Music of the Raj
(New York: Oxford University Press, 2000), Opera and
Drama in Eighteenth-Century London: The King’s Theatre,
Garrick and the Business of Performance (Cambridge:
Cambridge University Press, 2002) and Salomon and the
Burneys: Private Patronage and a Public Career (Aldershot:
Ashgate, 2003). His current project is on the early manu-
script sources of Così fan tutte and Don Giovanni.
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