
 

informed consent, based on a short informative video for patients waiting to undergo a coronary angiography 
procedure in Italy.  

Methods: The study involved 40 participants, 28 males and 12 females (mean age: 68.55, SD = 13.03), equally 
divided into two groups, one that received video informed consent and the other the traditional written one. 
Each group was asked to fill out two questionnaires, one created ad hoc by the authors to measure the level of 
understanding of the information provided and the perception of usefulness of informed consent, and the other 
the DASS-21 scale, able to assess anxiety, depression and stress levels.  

Results: Comparing the results of the two groups showed that informed consent via video enabled participants to 
better understand the information provided, as well as feel more confident in their subjective understanding of it, 
while perceiving informed consent via video as more useful than the traditional one. Video informed consent did 
not lead to higher levels of anxiety, depression, or stress among participants.  

Conclusion: it can be hypothesized that video formats could represent a more useful and understandable 
alternative to traditional informed consent in the coronary angiography procedure sector.  
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Objectives: Caregiving can be a daunting and isolating experience, especially when supporting a loved one with 
Dementia The objective of this intervention was to provide a series of educational sessions available to caregivers 
to help educate them on strategies to enhance their well-being and interactions with a loved one living with 
dementia.  

Methods: The Caregiver Literacy Series is a compilation o 18 webinar sessions with therapeutic workbooks 
designed to help caregivers understand the nature of specific dementia-related issues, and designed to help the 
caregiver build some personal strategy to help better manage their caregiving role. Based upon a Framework that 
uses the Perceived Self-Efficacy Theory, each webinar provides educational materials, and resources and is 
designed to help build an action plan for the caregiver. Topics include “What is Caregiving?”, “Caregiving and 
Compassion Fatigue and Self-Care” and topics address coping and communication strategies. The webinar 
sessions were administered monthly and semi-monthly to consumers through a local Alzheimer’s Association 
network in the rural Midwest of the United States.  

Results: Feedback from consumers who have used the materials suggest that the materials have provided some 
measure of information and helpful educational materials. The workbooks have also been an effective tool to 
help guide and empower the caregiver.  

Conclusion: The Caregiver Literacy Series provides some effective and needed materials to help equip caregivers 
living with a loved one that has Dementia or Alzheimer’s disease with some measure of health literacy and 
empowers them to feel some sense of empowerment and comfort in the process.  
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