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The Association for the
Advancement of Medical Instrumen-
tation is collaborating with a number
of organizations to cosponsor a con-
ference on “Designing, Testing, and
Labeling Reusable Medical Devices
for Reprocessing in Healthcare

Facilities” to be held April 9-10, 1996,
in Washington DC. Cosponsoring
organizations include the Health
Industry Manufacturer Association,
the Food and Drug Administration,
American Medical Association, the
Association for Professionals in
Infection Control and Epidemiology,
and the Association of Operating
Room Nurses.

Conference topics will include
reprocessing techniques, the perspec-
tive of technicians, an overview of stan-
dards and regulations, device design
considerations, manufacturer respon-
sibilities regarding reusable devices,
and the future of reprocessing.

For more information, call (703)
525-4890, ext 260.

Conference on Reuse of Medical Devices
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