
of scholars on the American shore. He was
an activist and an institution builder who
thought that democratic politics was too
important to be left to governments.

ProfessorGirardwill be remembered in
the United States in particular for his pas-
sionate attention to transatlantic relations.
Much like Raymond Aron and Jean-
BaptisteDuroselle of an earlier era,Michel
Girard cared about Europe and North
America. Displaying institutional leader-
ship as well as insight, Michel Girard left
political science and the world of politics a
better place because of his extraordinary
initiative and intellectual vision.

Charles Doran
Johns Hopkins University,

School of Advanced International Studies

LEROYHARDY

LeroyC.Hardy, emeritus professor of polit-
ical science at California State University,
Long Beach (CSULB), passed away on
November 2, 2008, at the age of 81. He spe-
cialized in California government and pol-
itics and was best known as a long-term
consultant to state legislators on the sub-
ject of the reapportionment of legislative
districts.

Professor Hardy taught full time in the
CSULBPolitical ScienceDepartment from
February 1953 until his retirement in 1986;
after which he taught on a part-time basis
until the early 1990s.He chaired the depart-
ment from 1980 to 1984. After leaving the
department, he taught in the CSULB
Senior University until shortly before his
death. Teaching was his first priority, and
he was a popular teacher.

Born inOklahoma and raised in South-
ernCalifornia,ProfessorHardyreceivedhis
BA degree from the University of Califor-
nia, Santa Barbara, in 1949, and his Ph.D.
from UCLA in 1955. While still a UCLA
graduate student working on the reappor-
tionment of legislative districts, he was
appointed in1951 to theresearchstaffof the
Republican-controlled State Reapportion-
mentCommittee, andhis contributionwas
so widely admired that he was called upon
again in 1961by theDemocratic-controlled
California legislature. He participated as
well in census-induced redistricting in the
early 1970s and 1980s, and in the special
redistricting forced by the U.S. Supreme
Court’s decision in themid-1960smandat-
ing oneman, one vote.

Professor Hardy’s ability to work with
both parties on reapportionment issues
reflected the integrity and responsibility of
his approach to those issues. It also
reflected enormous attention to detail,
especially in his earliest work before the
advent of computers, when reapportion-
ment workwas extremely time consuming
and laborious. Careers of federal and state
legislators depended upon this work.

From his vantage point as a reappor-
tionment expert, Professor Hardy aspired
tomake reapportionment of legislative dis-
tricts something other than an exercise
favoring political incumbents. At first he
believed that government would be more
disinterested if a city or community were
served by several legislators rather than
being incorporated into one district.

Subsequently, following heavily politi-
cized (gerrymandered) redistricting inCal-
ifornia in the early 1980s, which he
criticized, Professor Hardy helped develop
an elaborate bottom-up, community-based,
and non-partisan reapportionment con-
cept establishing very small but perma-
nent binding units of redistricting to
insulate reapportionment from politics as
much as possible. These building-block
units, which were implemented in state
redistricting in Arizona, were designed to
be aggregated into compact legislative dis-
tricts that would respect county and city
boundaries. They were designed to make
reapportionment immune from incum-
bent manipulation, and thereby to make
party politics more competitive.

Hardy worked to develop the com-
munity-based concept, while serving as a
senior research associate at the Rose Insti-
tute atClaremontMcKennaCollege,where
he collaborated on a series of writings,
including Reapportionment Politics (1981),
which he editedwithAlanHeslop and Stu-
artAnderson, andRedistricting in the 1980’s:
A 50-State Survey (1993) with Alan Heslop
and George S. Blair. Hardy also wrote two
texts for students, California Government
(Canfield Press, 4th ed., 1973), and, with
RobertMorlan,Politics of California (Dick-
enson Publishing Co., 1968).

Barry H. Steiner,
California State University, Long Beach

WILLIAMV.MOORE

On April 25, 2009, the College of Charles-
ton and the Charleston community lost a
beloved teacher, mentor, scholar, and col-

league, William V. Moore, distinguished
professor of political science.

In his 37 year career at the college, Dr.
Moore was, first and foremost, a truly
devoted teacher andmentor.He heldmany
different titles and undertook many
responsibilities over the span of his career,
but he always identified himself as a
teacher. His courses were invariably the
first to reach capacity; one of themost per-
sistent tasks for the chair of the depart-
mentwas explaining to students that there
simply were no more seats available in Dr.
Moore’s class. He always had an extremely
large number of advisees and took on spe-
cial responsibilities for student-athletes,
always mindful of the special challenges
posed by pursuing both athletic and aca-
demic achievement.

A caring father and family man, Bill,
balanced the life of a teacher with an
impressive scholarly output, a passionate
commitment to College of Charleston ath-
letics, and a willingness to share his exper-
tise with both print and television
journalists in Charleston and across the
country. He was as much the voice of the
political science department as he was
the voice of Cougar basketball.

Bill earned his BA and masters degrees
from Southern Illinois University and his
Ph.D. from Tulane. He was a well-known
expert on South Carolina politics, South-
ern politics, and political extremism. He
was the author of Political Extremism in the
United States, co-author of South Carolina
Politics and Government, as well as numer-
ous scholarly articles, encyclopedia entries,
and publications on Southern and extrem-
ist politics, civil rights, electoral politics,
campaign spending, and intergovernmen-
tal relations. He served as chair of the
department of political science, director
of the master of public administration
program, speaker of the faculty, director
of summer programs, director of the Taft
Institute for high school civics teachers,
NCAA faculty representative, and vice
president and president of the Southern
Conference. In 1997, Bill was designated
as the S.C. Governor’s Professor of the
Year. He has also been awarded the dis-
tinguished teaching award at the college
(1981), as well as the distinguished ser-
vice award (2000), the distinguished ad-
vising award (2001), and the first-ever
distinguished teacher-scholar award
(2001). Bill also served on the Board
of Advisors at the Charleston School of
Law.

I n Memor i am
.............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................
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He will be greatly missed by students,
student-athletes, alumni, faculty, staff, and
area journalists. He is survived byKathryn
Heape; his son, Mark Sheldon Moore; his
daughter, Laura Meredith Moore; his sis-
ter, FrancisMoore;MikkoLamminen; Erik
Lamminen; StephanieHeape Reller; Jason
Reller; Quinn and Brewington Reller;
LauraHeapeBrisson; BradleyBrisson; and
Kathryn Brisson.

Philip H. Jos
College of Charleston

IRA ROHTER

Ira Rohter, professor of political science
at the University of Hawai‘i since 1968,
passed away on June 22, 2009. He was well
known in the community as a leading
scholar-activist. Professor Rohter wrote the
pathbreaking book A Green Hawaii: A
Sourcebook for Development Alternatives. It
helped others to see the possibilities for
going beyond criticism of the current order
to undertake positive, transformative
action.

Professor Rohter regularly taught
courses in the politics of Hawaii, political
ecology and development, environmental
politics, and alternative futures. In and out
of the classroom, heprovided apositive role
model for students and for many others in
the state. He was one of the founders of
the Green Party in Hawai‘i, and helped to
bring about the first election of a Green
Party member to public office. He was a
foundingmember of theTransformational
Politics section of APSA.

Professor Rohter was actively involved
in public policy issues dealing with social
justice, environmentalism, and commu-
nity economicwell being.He authored bills
and legislation and led campaigns to get
them passed in county councils and the
state legislature. He wrote frequent op-ed
pieces andwas knownbymany officehold-
ers and media people for his analyses of
Hawai‘i political trends and his knowl-
edge about alternative energy, sustainable
agriculture and forestry, and grassroots
political activism.

He served as the president of theHawaii
Clean Elections project and as a vice pres-
ident of the Hawaii Coalition Against
Legalized Gambling. His far-reaching par-
ticipation in local activist organizations
allowed him to develop extensive intern-
ship opportunities for students, many of
whom went on to political careers.

Professor Rohter’s accomplishments
cannot be recorded as a list of publications
in a vita, but they are reflected in themany
blogs that honoredhimat his passing.Here
is just one example:

A truly inspiring and great man who in my
first year as a Poli Sci major at UH showed
me the way and gave me enthusiasm and
passion for Hawai‘is future. I hope that we
will be able to let his legacy live on as he
envisioned in his book Green Hawai‘i. He
was encouraging and gave me hope that
after all of his years of activism for Hawai‘i
there is spirit in the youth of today that we
can overcome the destruction that has
come over Hawai‘i. His ideas and work will
live on in all of us students who want what
is best for Hawai‘i.

Kathy E. Ferguson
University of Hawai‘i

George Kent
University of Hawai‘i

GEORGE ALBROWARP

A life of service to others ended on March
26, 2009, when professor emeritus George
A.Warp of theHumphrey Institute of Pub-
lic Affairs of the University of Minnesota
passed away at age 95. Georgewas born on
June 12, 1913, inNorthfield,Ohio, and grad-
uated from Bedford High School in Ohio.
Prior to being associated with the Univer-
sity of Minnesota for the past 60 years, he
graduated from Oberlin College, Case
WesternUniversity, andColumbiaUniver-
sity, earning degrees in political science,
public administration, international ad-
ministration, as well as law. George served
briefly as a political science faculty mem-
ber at the University of Minnesota, where
he met and married his late wife, Lois, in
1940 before entering theU.S. Navy follow-
ing the entry of the United States into
WorldWar II. His service in the Pacific the-
ater led to his postwar appointment as a
civilian advisor under General MacArthur
in Japan from 1946–1948. Upon comple-
tion of that assignment, George returned
to the University of Minnesota in 1948 as
a professor of political science and served
first as associate director and then director
of the graduate program in public admin-
istration in the department’s Public
Administration Center until 1965 when
the center became a self-standing unit of
the College of Liberal Arts. He remained
director through 1968 when the center
was succeeded by the School of Public

Affairs and recreated as the Humphrey
Institute of Public Affairs in 1978 as a col-
legiate unit named as a memorial honor-
ing the late vice president andMinnesota’s
senator. George served as a professor and
chair of graduate admissions until his
retirement in 1982.

In his leadership of the public admin-
istration program, George was tireless and
dedicated in serving the academic and
career interests and needs of the students
who sought preparation for public service
and academic careers. In the classroom, he
had a quiet, unassuming, unflappable
approach, ever guiding, never combative,
alwayswith the students’ interests at heart.
One of George’s greatest contributions to
the university’s public affairs programswas
formalizing internships as part of the cur-
riculum.Hebelieved that students in a pro-
fessional programneededpractical training
and relevant field experience to comple-
ment their coursework. One alumnus
noted, “George pretty much invented the
concept of paid internships in the public
sector in Minnesota, using his contacts to
obtain part time support for almost our
entire class.To this day there are hundreds
of former studentswhowill attest that they
are indebted to George for their careers,
which began as public administration
internships when they were his students.”

With host financial sponsorships of
internships now more difficult to secure,
in 2006, George made a sizeable stock gift
to the Humphrey Institute to establish the
George A. Warp Internship Fund to pro-
vide grants to support public policy and
planning students who conduct unpaid or
low-paying internships as part of their
degree programs. His financial legacy
reflects his commitment to the internship
concept.

Not only wasGeorge known nationally
and internationally in the field of admin-
istration, but within the university he ini-
tiatedmany interdisciplinary efforts to join
a public administration curricular dimen-
sion to graduate programs in agriculture,
social work, architecture, public health, as
well as law, in some cases leading to joint-
degree programs.

In his post retirement yearsGeorgewas
active in the founding of the University of
MinnesotaRetireesAssociation, serving as
one of its early presidents, and in the for-
mation of the Minnesota Senior Federa-
tion, of which he also served as president.
An avid university sports fan, he main-
tained to the end season tickets to Gopher
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