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GUIDE FOR CONTRIBUTORS

Articles: Manuscripts should be submitted to
the DRJ editor. DRJ is a refereed journal using
a blind review process. Article manuscripts
must be accompanied by written assurance that
they have not been published, submitted, or
accepted for publication elsewhere. They will
not be returned unless accompanied by return
postage.

Manuscripts should contribute original
material. They maybe discussions of contem-
porary or historical dance, theory and methods,
critical syntheses, or evaluations of the state of
knowledge or methods in the different disci-
plines involved in dance research. The editor
and at least two outside readers evaluate ar-
ticles. Every attempt is made to notify authors
regarding acceptance within three months. The
editor reserves the right to reject or return for
revision any material on the grounds of inap-
propriate subject matter, quality, or length.

Authors must submit manuscripts to the
current editor through email. Prepare the
manuscript for blind review by creating a
separate title page, including name, manu-
script title, and contact information. The entire
manuscript, including notes, bibliography, and
indented long quotations, should be double-
spaced. Notes and bibliographies should follow
the Chicago Manual of Style, 15th ed. (author-
date citation system). Illustrative materials,
such as graphs, maps, and graphic notation,
should be done in black ink and should be
camera ready. Photographs should have a
glossy finish. Illustrative materials may also be
submitted in digital form: 1200 dpi for line art
and 300 dpi for photographs; TIFF is the pre-
ferred format. Authors must obtain permission
to publish illustrative materials if by individuals
other than themselves. All manuscripts must
be accompanied by an abstract of 50—100 words
and biographical information of four to six
lines that includes current evidence of expertise
in the topic of the article.

Reviews: Book and media reviews are assigned
by the Reviews editor, but individuals wish-
ing to review a particular book may submit
an inquiry to the Reviews editor. Reviews in
the current issue are the best guide to correct
format. The heading should include name of

author(s) or editor(s), book title (italicized),
place of publication, name of publisher, year of
publication, number of pages, cloth or paper-
bound, and price. Reviews should be scholarly
in orientation and approximately 1,200-1,500
words in length. A parallel format should be
used for film and other material.

Criticism and Reports: Individuals wishing
to submit performance criticism or report on
an archive or project are encouraged to submit
an inquiry. DRJ prints performance criticism,
especially commentary enlivened through
theoretical or historical analysis and presented
in an innovative format. Reports should
include what, where, when, who, and how, and
should specify the relevance of the activity to
dance research. Related literature should be
cited, if relevant.

Final Manuscript Approval: Authors of
articles will be consulted before editorial deci-
sions are made final. Page proofs will be sent
during the production process and should be
examined by authors and returned within the
specified time.

Copyright: DRJ publishes previously unpub-
lished original research. CORD copyrights
each issue of the journal as a collective work;
individual authors retain rights to their
individual works. Authors of individual works
published in CORD have the right to repub-
lish their own work in whole or in part, and
in identical or modified form. As the original
publisher, CORD requests a letter to the Chair
of the CORD editorial board regarding any
republication. All republications, in whatever
form, must be credited with one of the follow-
ing statements:

This article was originally published in
Dance Research Journal, Vol. (number), No.
(number), (date).

or
An earlier version of this article appeared in
Dance Research Journal, Vol. (number), No.
(number), (date).

Complimentary Copies: Contributors of
major articles will receive three complimentary
copies of the issue in which their article was
published; authors of reviews and reports will
receive two complimentary copies.
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