WEYL'S THEOREM FOR f(T) WHEN T IS A DOMINANT OPERATOR

IN HO JEON. EUNGIL KO*

Department of Mathematics, Ewha Women's University, Seoul 120-750, Korea e-mail: jih@math.ewha.ac.kr, eiko@mm.ewha.ac.kr

and HONG YOUL LEE**

Department of Mathematics, Jeonju Woosuk University, Korea e-mail: hylee@core.woosuk.ac.kr

(Received 14 December, 1999)

Abstract. Let T be a dominant operator that is a quasi-affine transform of an M-hyponormal operator. In this paper we show that if f is a function analytic on a neighborhood of the spectrum of T, then Weyl's theorem holds for f(T).

1991 Mathematics Subject Classification. Primary 47A53, 47A10.

1. Introduction. Let \mathcal{H} be an infinite dimensional complex Hilbert space and let $B(\mathcal{H})$ denote the algebra of bounded linear operators on \mathcal{H} . Recall ([10], [12], [13]) that an operator $T \in B(\mathcal{H})$ is said to be *dominant* if for each $\lambda \in \mathbb{C}$ there exists a positive number M_{λ} such that

$$(T-\lambda)(T-\lambda)^* < M_{\lambda}(T-\lambda)^*(T-\lambda).$$

If the constants M_{λ} are bounded by a positive real number M, then T is said to be M-hyponormal. Also we note that if T is 1-hyponormal, then T is hyponormal. Evidently,

$$hyponormal \Rightarrow M-hyponormal \Rightarrow dominant. \tag{1.1}$$

If $T \in B(\mathcal{H})$, then we shall denote by $\sigma(T)$, $\sigma_p(T)$, $\pi_0(T)$, $\pi_{00}(T)$, and iso $\sigma(T)$ the spectrum of T, the set of all eigenvalues of T, the set of all eigenvalues of finite multiplicity of T, the set of all isolated eigenvalues of finite multiplicity of T, and the set of all isolated points of $\sigma(T)$, respectively. An operator $T \in B(\mathcal{H})$ is called *Fredholm* if the range of T is closed and ker T and ker T^* are both finite dimensional. If T is Fredholm, then the *index* of T is defined by

$$ind(T) = dim ker(T) - dim ker(T^*).$$

A Fredholm operator with index zero is called Weyl ([5], [6]). The Weyl spectrum of T, denoted by $\omega(T)$, is defined by

$$\omega(T) = \{\lambda \in \mathbb{C} : T - \lambda \text{ is not Weyl}\}.$$

^{*}This work was supported by the Brain Korea 21 project.

^{**}This work was partially supported by Woosuk University Research Fund.

Following L. A. Coburn [2] we say that Weyl's theorem holds for T if

$$\omega(T) = \sigma(T) - \pi_{00}(T).$$

In a vast literature, there exist several classes of operators for which Weyl's theorem holds. In particular, Coburn [2, Theorem (3.1)] showed that Weyl's theorem holds for hyponormal operators. This was extended to M-hyponormal operators by Arora and Kumer [1, Theorem 4]. On the other hand, using results of Oberai [9], Lee and Lee [8] showed that the spectral mapping theorem holds for $\omega(T)$ and Weyl's theorem holds for f(T) when T is hyponormal and f is a function analytic on a neighborhood of $\sigma(T)$. Recently, this was also improved by Hou and Zhang [7] to show that the spectral mapping theorem holds for the Weyl spectrum of a dominant operator T and that Weyl's theorem holds for f(T) when T is M-hyponormal and f is a function analytic on a neighborhood of $\sigma(T)$.

From the viewpoint of (1.1), it is natural to ask if Weyl's theorem holds for a dominant operator T. In general, however, the answer is negative. See Example 5. This is a motivation to write this paper, and so we shall consider a subclass of dominant operators for which the above question has an affirmative answer.

Recall ([4], [14]) that an operator $T \in B(\mathcal{H})$ is said to be a *quasi-affine transform* of $S \in B(\mathcal{H})$ if there exists an injection $X \in B(\mathcal{H})$ with dense range such that SX = XT, and this relation of T and S is denoted by $T \prec S$. If both $T \prec S$ and $S \prec T$, then we say that T and S are *quasi-similar*. In general, quasi-similarity preserves the point spectrum but not the spectrum, the set of all eigenvalues of finite multiplicity, the set of all isolated eigenvalues, nor the set of all isolated points of the spectrum. It is also well known that quasi-similarity (even similarity) does not preserve hyponormality, M-hyponormality, and dominantness of operators.

In this paper we shall prove the following result, which enables us to extend Theorem 3.5 in [7] or Theorem 2 in [8].

THEOREM. Let T, S be a dominant operator and an M-hyponormal operator, respectively. If $T \prec S$ and f is a function analytic on a neighborhood of $\sigma(T)$, then Weyl's theorem holds for f(T).

2. Proof of Theorem. We begin with an improvement of a result of Arora and Kumer [1, Theorem 4].

LEMMA 1. Let T, S be a dominant operator and an M-hyponormal operator, respectively. If $T \prec S$, then Weyl's theorem holds for T.

Proof. If T is dominant, then $T - \lambda$ is also dominant for $\lambda \in \mathbb{C}$, and so it suffices to prove that $0 \in \sigma(T) - \omega(T)$ if and only if $0 \in \pi_{00}(T)$. First, let $0 \in \sigma(T) - \omega(T)$. Then T is Weyl but not invertible, and so $0 \in \pi_0(T)$. Also, we have the following statement:

$$\ker(T) = \ker(T^*) = \operatorname{ran}(T)^{\perp} \implies \ker(T)^{\perp} = \operatorname{ran}(T).$$

Since ker(T) is a reducing subspace for T we have the following decompositions;

$$T = 0 \oplus T'$$
 with respect to $\mathcal{H} = \ker(T) \oplus \ker(T)^{\perp}$. (2.1)

Thus T' is onto, so that T' is invertible and $0 \in iso\sigma(T)$. Hence $0 \in \pi_{00}(T)$.

Conversely, let $0 \in \pi_{00}(T)$. We can consider a Riesz projection P_0^T corresponding to 0 such that $P_0^T T = T P_0^T [11]$. Then the following is well known:

$$P_0^T(\mathcal{H}) = \mathcal{M}_T$$
, where $\mathcal{M}_T = \{x \in \mathcal{H} : ||T^n x||^{\frac{1}{n}} \rightarrow 0\}.$

Hence $T|_{P_0^T(\mathcal{H})}$ is also a dominant and quasi-nilpotent operator [3, Lemma p. 28]. Now, we claim that

$$P_0^T(\mathcal{H}) = \ker(T). \tag{2.2}$$

Since, by the assumption, there exists an injection X with dense range such that SX = XT, we can see that $iso\sigma(T) \subset \sigma(S)$ because if $\lambda \in iso\sigma(T)$, then by Theorem 2.5 in [4], we have

$$\{\lambda\} = \sigma(T|_{P_{i}^{T}(\mathcal{H})}) \cap \sigma(S) \neq \emptyset.$$

Also since every M-hyponormal operator is similar to a subdecomposable operator [14, Theorem 1.1] we can see that $\sigma(S) \subset \sigma(T)$, by Theorem 2.1 in [14]. Thus $0 \in \text{iso}\sigma(T) \subset \text{iso}\sigma(S)$. We can also consider a Riesz projection P_0^S corresponding to 0 for S and then $P_0^S(\mathcal{H})$ is an invariant subspace of S. Also since

$$||S^n(Xx)||^{\frac{1}{n}} \le ||X||^{\frac{1}{n}}||T^nx||^{\frac{1}{n}} \text{ for } x \in \mathcal{H},$$

the quasi-nilpotency of $T|_{P_0^T(\mathcal{H})}$ implies the quasi-nilpotency of $S|_{P_0^S(\mathcal{H})}$. Thus $S|_{P_0^S(\mathcal{H})}$ is quasi-nilpotent and M-hyponormal; hence $S|_{P_0^S(\mathcal{H})}$ is a zero operator by [10, Corollary 5]. Since 0 is an isolated point in both $\sigma(T)$ and $\sigma(S)$, by Lemma 2.1 in [4] we have $P_0^S X = X P_0^T$. Thus we have

$$0 = SP_0^S X = SXP_0^T = XTP_0^T.$$

It follows that $T|_{P_0^T(\mathcal{H})}$ is also a zero operator. Hence $P_0^T(\mathcal{H}) \subset \ker(T)$ and, since the reverse inclusion is clear, we have equality (2.2). Then, from (2.1), T' is invertible, and so $\ker(T)^{\perp} = \overline{\operatorname{ran}(T)}$. Hence, by the assumption $0 < \dim \ker(T) < \infty$, we get

$$\ker(T) = \overline{\operatorname{ran}(T)}^{\perp} = \operatorname{ran}(T)^{\perp} = \ker(T^*),$$

and thus *T* is Weyl but not invertible; that is, $0 \in \sigma(T) - \omega(T)$.

Remark 2. In the middle of the proof of Lemma 1, we note that T is *isoloid*; i.e., $iso\sigma(T) \subset \sigma_p(T)$ because

$$0 \in iso\sigma(T) \Longrightarrow P_0^T(\mathcal{H}) = \ker(T) \neq \{0\}.$$

LEMMA 3 [7, Theorem 2.2]. Let T be a dominant operator and f a function analytic on a neighborhood of $\sigma(T)$. Then $\omega(f(T)) = f(\omega(T))$.

Lemma 4. Let T, S be a dominant operator and an M-hyponormal operator, respectively. If $T \prec S$ and f is a function analytic on a neighborhood of $\sigma(T)$, then we have

$$\sigma(f(T)) - \pi_{00}(f(T)) = f(\sigma(T) - \pi_{00}(T)).$$

Proof. Since T is isoloid, as mentioned in Remark 2, applying it to Lemma in [8] the proof immediately follows.

Proof of Theorem. Since T is dominant, by Lemma 3 we have $\omega(f(T)) = f(\omega(T))$. Thus from Lemma 1 it follows that

$$f(\sigma(T) - \pi_{00}(T)) = f(\omega(T)) = \omega(f(T)).$$

Hence, by Lemma 4, we have

$$\sigma(f(T)) - \pi_{00}(f(T)) = \omega(f(T)).$$

We conclude with the following example which shows that, in general, Weyl's theorem does not hold for a dominant operator (even isoloid) but not M-hyponormal operator.

EXAMPLE 5. We consider an operator $T = 0 \oplus W$ as a direct sum of a zero operator acting on a finite dimensional space and a unilateral weighted shift W acting on ℓ^2 defined by

$$W(x_1, x_2, x_3, \cdots) = (0, x_1/2, x_2/3, x_3/4, \cdots).$$

Since an operator $S \in B(\mathcal{H})$ is dominant if and only if $\operatorname{ran}(S) \subset \operatorname{ran}(S^*)$ [12], we can see that $T = 0 \oplus W$ is dominant. Furthermore, T is quasi-nilpotent but not zero. From a simple calculation, we deduce that

$$\sigma(T) = \{0\}, \ \omega(T) = \{0\}, \ \sigma_n(T) = \{0\}, \ \text{and} \ \pi_{00} = \{0\}.$$

We see that T is isoloid but Weyl's theorem does not hold for T. Hence T is not M-hyponormal.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS. The first and second authors were partially supported by Brain Ewha Math 21.

REFERENCES

- 1. S. C. Arora and R. Kumer, M-hyponormal operators, Yokohama Math. J. 28 (1980), 41–44.
- 2. L. A. Coburn, Weyl's theorem for nonnormal operators, *Michigan Math. J.* 13 (1966), 285–288.
- 3. I. Colojoara and C. Foias, *Theory of generalized spectral operators* (Gordon and Breach, 1968).
- **4.** L. A. Fialkow, A note on quasisimilarity of operators, *Acta Sci. Math.*(*Szeged*) **39** (1977), 67–85.

- 5. R. E. Harte, Weyl and Browder theory, Proc. Roy. Irish Acad. Sect. A. 85 (1985), 151-176.
- **6.** R. E. Harte, *Invertibility and singularity for bounded linear operators* (Marcel Dekker, 1988).
- 7. J. Hou and X. Zhang, On the Weyl spectrum: Spectral mapping theorem and Weyl's theorem, J. Math. Anal. Appl. 220 (1998), 760–768.
- **8.** W. Y. Lee and S. H. Lee, A spectral mapping theorem for the Weyl spectrum, *Glasgow Math. J.* **38** (1996), 61–64.
 - 9. K. K. Oberai, On the Weyl spectrum (II), *Illinois J. Math.* 21 (1977), 84–90.
- **10.** M. Radjablipour, On majorization and normality of operators, *Proc. Amer. Math. Soc.* **62** (1977), 105–110.
 - 11. F. Riesz and B. Sz.-Nagy, Functional analysis (Fredrick Unger, 1955).
- 12. J. G. Stampfli and B. L. Wadhwa, An asymmetric Putnam-Fuglede theorem for dominant operators, *Indiana Univ. Math. J.* 25 (1976), 359–365.
- 13. J. G. Stampfli and B. L. Wadhwa, On dominant operators, *Monatsh. Math.* 84 (1977), 143–153.
- **14.** L. Yang, Quasi-similarity of hyponormal and subdecomposable operators, *J. Funct. Anal.* **112** (1993), 204–217.