
THE LIFE
OF THE SP/R/T

Training For
PERFECTION

A. M. SELO, AMBROSE FARRELL
JOHN MORSON, F. MIDDLEWICK

VOL. IX AUGUST 1954 No, 98

BLACKFRIARS
34 Bloomsbury Street, W.C.I

Price is. 6d.



'Herder S7\ g) If All books

Service' S J\AteuM
Two outstanding works

EPISTEMOLOGY
ONTOLOGY

BOTH BY THE REV. F. VAN STEENBERGHEN

'It would be difficult to praise these two volumes too highly. In the
first place the need for something of this kind is very great in England.
Some good work of course has been done by native philosophers,
Professor Hawkins is outstanding and also Fr Hughes. But here we
have a full summary of the Thomist synthesis in these two subjects.
Professor Steenberghen does not claim to do anything more than pro-
vide a student's introduction to each subject. Thus, on the one hand he
avoids overloading with abstruse and unnecessary side issues; and on
the other he is careful to start at the beginning. It is those initial steps
which are so essential for the beginner. Leave them out, and it is like
leaving out the water when boiling the kettle.

It would be difficult to praise, I repeat, the publication of these
translations too highly, for another reason. Metaphysics and Epistemo-
logy are two subjects most in need of elucidation today. It is for lack of
sound metaphysics that modern philosophers are floundering in a
morass of uncertainties.

The approach to the proof for the existence of God is the most
refreshing statement of the situation I have seen. It does not treat St
Thomas as infallible, at least in his arrangement; it recognizes that his
approach was conditioned to a certain extent by the time in which he
lived. "We feel as we read that at last the cobwebs have been brushed
aside and we face the problem in a purely metaphysical frame of mind.

Through a true understanding of the nature of Being and of the
primary object of our perception alone will a sound treatment of
epistemology and of metaphysics be restored. And if this is the true
diagnosis of the modern malady of philosophers, then they must begin
with repeated doses of metaphysics, and could not do better than begin
with these two books.'—The Dublin Review.

Epistemology 30/- Ontology 27/-
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