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Instructions for authors

Fetal and Maternal Medicine Review will accept reviews on all
areas of maternal and fetal medicine. Although reviews are
carefully solicited by the Editor-in-Chief, authors are also
encouraged to submit reviews for publication.

To submit a manuscript, send three complete copies, in-
cluding figures and illustrations to William Dunlop, Editor:
Fetal and Maternal Medicine Review, Department of Obstetrics
and Gynaecology, 4th Floor, Leazes Wing, Royal Victoria
Infirmary, Newcastle upon Tyne, NE1 4LP, UK. Telephone:
+44191232 5131 Ext 24132.

Manuscripts will be acknowledged only if the author encloses
a stamped addressed postcard or international reply coupon.

There is no formal restriction on length. However, reviews
should be of appoximately 8,000 words.

Type double-spaced throughout on one side only and number
all pages consecutively. Following acceptance authors are
encouraged to submit their final revised version of the paper
on a personal computer disk, using WordPerfect, together
with one hard copy version. Disks will not be returned. The
publisher reserves the right to typeset any article by con-
ventional means if the author's disk proves unusable.

Manuscripts should be prepared using SI units, with, if
necessary, traditional units in parentheses. In tables and
figures only SI units should be used, but blood pressure
should be expressed in mmHg and haemoglobin as g/dl. Full
stops should be used after contraction or abbreviations.
Abbreviations should be spelled out when first used in the
text unless it is a standard unit of measurement. Drugs should
be given their approved, not proprietary, names and the
source of any new or experimental preparation should be
given.

Any statistical method should be detailed in the paper and
new methods detailed in full or supported by references.

Figures should be numbered consecutively as they appear in
the text. Mark each figure with the first author's name and
figure number on the reverse, and indicate its orientation.
Any indication of features of special interest should also be in-
cluded. Authors should submit three copies of each illus-
tration. Figures should be drawn or produced by computer to
about twice the final size; wherever possible they will be
reproduced with the authors original lettering. Photographs
should be submitted with the proposed reduction or magni-
fication indicated and referred to in the text as 'Fig. 1', etc.,

and noted in the margin of the typescript for insertion.
Legends for all illustrations should be typed together, separ-
ately from the main text. A charge will be made for colour
photograph reproduction.

Patients in photographs should not be identifiable and should
have their eyes masked to conceal identity. Any identifiable
photograph should be accompanied by written permission
from the patient or the patient's parent or guardian where
appropriate. If material has been published elsewhere, written
consent for republication must be obtained from the copyright
holder.

Tables with concise headings should be typed on separate
sheets and numbered consecutively. Each table must have a
text reference, in the form 'Table 1', etc. Indicate where tables
are to be placed by means of a note in the margin.

References should follow the \fcncouver style* and be
numbered in the order that appears in the text. The full list of
references should give the names and initials of all authors
(unless there are more than six, when only the first six should
be given followed by et al.).The authors' names are followed by
the title of the review, the journal or book name (the former
being abbreviated in accordance with the style used in Index
Medtcus), volume number, first and last page reference.
References to books and conference proceedings should also
include place of publication and publisher (and editorfs) if
appropriate). Authors must verify references against the
original documents before submitting the review.

Proofs will be sent to the author for checking. Typographical
or factual errors may be changed at proof stage. The publisher
reserves the right to charge authors for correction of non-
typographical errors.

25 offprints of each review will be supplied free to each first
named author. Extra offprints may be purchased from the
publisher if ordered at proof stage.

Submission of a paper will be taken to imply that it is un-
published and it is not being considered for publication else-
where. Upon acceptance of a paper, the author will be asked to
transfer copyright to the publisher.

* International Committee of Medical Journal Editors.
Uniform requirements for manuscripts submitted to bio-
medical journals. Br MedJ 1991; 302: 338-41 or NEnglJMed
1991; 324:424-28
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