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Contributions and editorial correspondence should be sent to one of
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Don House, 46 Don Street, Aberdeen, AB2 IUU, Scotland.

Submission of an article is taken to imply that it has not previously
been published in English, or is not being considered by another
journal for publication in English. In the interests of authors, copy-
right is normally assigned to the Cambridge University Press. The
average length of articles is 5000 words. Although longer articles are
accepted, those in excess of 10,000 words cannot be considered.

Contributions (articles and reviews) should be clearly typed in
double spacing, and on one side of the paper only. The rule about
double spacing applies also to footnotes, which should be used
sparingly. Cross-references within the article offered should not be
included.

Notes for the editors and instructions for the printer should be
attached on separate sheets. Contributors should keep one copy of
the typescript for use in correcting proofs.

Contributors from the United States may use U.S. spellings. Greek
and Hebrew words need not be transliterated. Capitalisation should
be kept to a minimum; and in particular should not be used in
pronouns referring to the Deity.

First proofs of articles and article reviews may be read and corrected
by contributors, and should normally be returned to the organising
editor within ten days of receipt. Correction should be confined to
errors of the printer. More extensive correction can be made only
with the concurrence of an editor. No proofs of reviews will be sent.

Contributors of articles and article reviews (but not of reviews)
receive 25 free offprints. Extra copies may be bought according to
an agreed scale of charges, provided that these are ordered at the

\ time of returning corrected proofs.
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