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comprehensive in their treatment of individual subjects. The 
Handbook of Shock and Trauma, Volume HBasic Science, is an 
attempt by the authors to lay the foundation of knowledge 
necessary to comprehend subsequent volumes in this series. 

In the preface the editors state "The Handbook of Shock and 
Trauma presents to the investigator, student and clinician an 
incisively comprehensive analysis of the state of the art in 
shock research and management". Volume 1 meets these rather 
ambitious objectives in that it is a state of the art review of 
shock research up until 1981. The many contributors, most of 
whom are noted experts in their field, have done a good job in 
summarizing the legion of material published in their fields. 

The book is divided into six sections. The major sections 
include the Cardiovascular System in Shock, Other Organ 
Systems in Shock and Trauma, Cellular Alterations in Shock 
and Trauma, Subcellular Aspects, Neurohumoral, Hormonal, 
and Toxin Aspects of Shock and Shock Models, Species 
Specificity, and Anesthesia. All sections are well written and 
despite the multi-author format which inevitably will lead to 
some overlap, there is a good continuity to the book. Each 
section is preceeded by a short introduction that clearly explains 
the objectives of the section, who the authors are, and the 
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intended use of the knowledge within the section so that the 
text can be read in perspective. In general, illustrations are well 
presented and helpful. Especially well done are the chapters on 
the heart in shock and the peripheral circulation in shock as 
well as the section on the effect of shock on organ systems. 
However, the chapter on the sympathetic and central nervous 
systems in shock is somewhat less than comprehensive and 
likely reflects a relative lack of knowledge in this area. 

On the whole the book is an excellent multi-authored textbook 
which is well written and referenced. The nature of the subject 
dictates that the text is outdated at publication, but this does 
not deter from the usefulness of this volume as a basic reference 
guide to the topics reviewed. However, I do not see the average 
neurologist having much interest in the basic science of trauma 
and shock. This book is more likely to be of interest to those 
who work in Intensive Care Units and deal with shock and 
trauma on a day to day basis. As an intensivist, I am looking 
forward to Volume II which promises to develop therapeutic 
principles of shock management in a similar comprehensive 
way. 

R.A. Steinberg, 
Calgary, Alberta 
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