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Objective: To explore barriers towards mental health services for older adults with symptoms of depression 
and/or anxiety in a low-resource community in Lima, Peru. We explored these barriers from the perspective of 
older adults and health providers.  
Methods: We conducted an interview-based qualitative study. The first set of interviews was carried out between 
October 2018 and February 2019, and the second, between January 2022 and September 2022. In the first 
sample, we interviewed 38 older adults ≥60 years with symptoms of depression (Patient Health Questionnaire-9 ≥ 
10), anxiety (Beck Anxiety Inventory ≥ 16), or those who had previous experience using formal mental health care 
irrespective of current symptoms. In the second sample, we included 20 health providers (8 psychologists, 2 
general practitioners, 2 nurses, 4 psychiatrists, 4 social workers). We used an inductive thematic data analysis.   
Results: We identified two main barriers: stigma towards mental health conditions and care, and ageism. Stigma 
and ageism interacted with each other and exacerbated other barriers to mental health services. Stigma led to 
negative labels for people with mental health conditions and shame among older adults to disclose their feelings 
to health providers. Looking at the health system, health care facilities were described as not being age friendly. 
Additionally, aside from psychologists and psychiatrists, most providers mentioned little previous training in 
mental health care, but even less about the nuances of treating mental health challenges in old age. Among older 
adults, other important barriers were the accumulated mistrust towards health professionals and lack of 
knowledge about existing services and how they work. Importantly, older adults mentioned competing priorities, 
for example, not having time to seek care because they needed to work to obtain food. Other barriers included 
hidden costs incurred for transportation to health centers or to obtain medications. For older adults with 
diminished physical mobility, lack of accompaniment to attend health appointments was another important 
barrier.   
Conclusions: Community-based mental health interventions towards older adults need to address ageism and 
mental health stigma to improve access to care. Furthermore, training for health providers must be improved and 
expanded to prioritize older adult mental health care.  
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Background: The numbers of older people experiencing both homelessness and Alzheimer’s disease and related 

dementias are growing, yet their complex health, housing and care needs remain undelineated and unmet. Older 

people experiencing homelessness have high levels of memory and cognitive impairment relative to stably 
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