
increasing numbers and technical advance pro-
duce much of the unemployment. To increase
quality of life the individual in effect occupies
more space and uses more finite resources and so
compounds the population pressure. Increased
numbers may well have repercussions in ex-
cessive aggression between individuals and be-
tween nations.

We all work away in separate pressure groups,
following our personal special interests, trying to
relieve the situation.

Should we seek greater effectiveness by any
organisational expedients? Education in these
matters is of course essential but the time factor is
so long in comparison with the rapidity of popula-
tion increase.

Colin Bertram
Ricardo's, Graffham,
Petworth, Sussex GU28 OPU

Hermit ibis in Turkey
During a visit to Turkey (mainly in pursuit of
orchids) in May 1983, we made a pilgrimage to
the hermit ibis Geronticus eremita at Birecjk. We
were so impressed with what we found, and the
most recent report that I remember in Oryx was
so gloomy, that I thought that you might be inter-
ested, even though Birecik is so easy of access
that I expect it is often visited now.

The whole area of the nesting cliff is securely
fenced and there is an obviously very keen Turk-
ish warden/guardian. We counted 44 adult birds,
including those in a completely enclosed 'aviary',
but the real figure could be higher as there was a
succession of birds flying to and from the colony.
As the warden spoke no English, most of our
questions had to go unanswered, but we gained
the impression that the purpose of the 'aviary'
was to hold back a number of the birds from
migration. I did not count the young, but on 25
May there were birds that could not have been far
from flying as well as nests that still contained
eggs.

At least half the nests were on wooden shelves
erected against the cliff face, and the birds
appeared happy on these. Some were covered
with netting; as far as I could see the birds could
Letters

get out at the sides, and judging by the number of
rocks lying on top of the netting this is probably
for protection from natural rock-fall. Judging from
a quick visit it does look as though the colony is in
good heart and has recovered from its 'low' of
some years ago.

In spite of ever more intensive agriculture there is
a wealth of natural history interest in Turkey, and
still surprisingly little known. Much more work is
still required on the distribution map for birds.
And there are still new orchids to be found, at
least at subspecific level. I was checking up on a
probably new taxon I found in 1976, and found
an additional one this time. The big development
since our last long journey there in 1976 is the
rapid and extensive reafforestation. Somebody in
the Government must have this very much at
heart. And in some areas there are nesting boxes
by the hundred. As far as we could ascertain this
has been organised by the Government, not by a
voluntary body. I should so much like to know
more about this.

Dr T. Norman
The Old Rectory, Winterboume Houghton,
Blandford, Dorset DT11 OPD

In June 1978 Oryx (XIV, 3; 210) it was reported
that the number of hermit ibis in the colony near
Biregik had fallen to 34, from 1300 in 1953. The
species is endangered and there is only one
breeding colony in Turkey and 15 more scattered
in Morocco.
Editor

Visiting Taman Negara
I have recently spent two weeks in Taman Negara
in Malaysia. It is a really superb area, not least
because entry is only via a two-and-a-half-hour
river trip. There are several trails and hides, al-
though some trails are poorly maintained and
time and elephants succeed in blocking them.
Rubbish control is poor, unfortunately. Oppor-
tunities for seeing birds and mammals, however,
are excellent.

It is best to spend at least seven days in the Park to
allow for at least two or three days spent away
from Park Headquarters. A permit costs M$1.00
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